
ORDINANCE ___________ 

An ordinance relating to Permit Fees, Heating Mechanics Licenses, Building 

Official Review of Proposed Amendments to 17F, Fences, Adoption of Current State 

Building Codes, Elevators and Dangerous Conveyances, and Application for Worker’s 

Licenses amending SMC 08.02.031, 10.29.030, 11.19.720, 17C.110.230, 17F.030.010, 

17F.040.010, 17F.050.010, 17F.060.040, 17F.060.060, 17F.080.010; 17F.090.010, 

17F.100.010, and 17G.010.200.      

The City of Spokane does ordain: 

Section 1. That SMC 08.02.031 is amended to read as follows: 

Section 08.02.031 Building Code 

A. Building Permit. 

Building permit fees are based on the value of the work to be done as follows: 

VALUE OF WORK 

(in dollars) 

FEE 

(in dollars) 

1 - 500 

28.00 

501 - 2,000 

28.00 plus 3.00 for each 100 over 500 

2,001 - 25,000 

73.00 plus 13.00 for each 1,000 over 2,000 

25,001 - 50,000 

372.00 plus 10.00 for each 1,000 over 25,000 

50,001 - 100,000 

622.00 plus 7.00 for each 1,000 over 50,000 

100,001 - 500,000 

972.00 plus 5.00 for each 1,000 over 100,000 



 

 

500,001 - 1,000,000 

2,972.00 plus 4.00 for each 1,000 over 500,000 

1,000,001 - 99,999,999 

4,972.00 plus 3.00 for each 1,000 over 1,000,000 

  

B. Valuation. 

1. The value of construction for purposes of calculating the amount of the fee 

is determined by using the: 

a. most current building valuation data from the International Code 

((Conference))Council (ICC) as published ((in the “Building Safety 

Journal”))and updated by the ICC twice annually; or 

b. contract valuation, whichever is greater. 

2. “Gross area” when used in conjunction with the ICC building valuation 

data to determine valuation of a project is the total area of all floors, 

measured from the exterior face, outside dimension, or exterior column 

line of a building, including basements and balconies but excluding 

unexcavated areas. 

3. The fee is based on the highest type of construction to which a proposed 

structure most nearly conforms, as determined by the building official. 

4. For roofing permits, the value is determined to be: 

a. one hundred fifty dollars per square for recovering roofs; 

b. two hundred dollars per square for roofing projects when existing 

layers of roofing are torn off and a new layer is installed; 

c. two hundred fifteen dollars per square for roofing projects when 

existing layers of roofing are torn off, new sheeting is installed, and 

a new layer of roof is installed; 

d. or the contract valuation if it is greater.  

C. Building Plan Review. 

1. Plan review fees are sixty-five percent of the building permit fee as 

calculated from the table rounded up to the next whole dollar amount for: 

a. all commercial building permits; 

b. all industrial building permits; 



 

 

c. all mixed use building permits; and 

d. new multi-family residences with three or more units. 

2. Plan review fees are one hundred percent of the building permit fee as 

calculated from the table for fast-track projects. 

3. Plan review fees are twenty-five percent of the building permit fee as 

calculated from the table rounded up to the next whole dollar amount for 

new: 

a. single-family residences; and 

b. duplexes. 

4. Plan review fees are twenty-five dollars for: 

a. new buildings that are accessory structures for single-family 

residences and duplexes to include garages, pole buildings, 

greenhouses, sheds that require a permit, etc.; and 

b. additions to existing single family residences and duplexes to 

include living space, garages, sunrooms, decks, etc. 

5. Plan review fees for additional review required by changes, additions, or 

revisions to plans are seventy-five dollars per hour or fraction thereof. 

6. The building official may elect to assess plan review for remodeling single 

family residences and duplexes when required. This amount will be not be 

higher than the twenty-five percent of the building fee as calculated in the 

table rounded to the nearest whole dollar charged on a new single-family 

residence or duplex. 

D. Demolition. 

Demolition permit fees are: 

1. Single-family residence, duplex and accessory structures: Thirty-five 

dollars each. 

2. Other structures:  Thirty-five dollars for every thousand square feet, to a 

maximum fee of three hundred fifty dollars. 

3. The processing fee is twenty-five dollars. 

4. For historic landmarks and contributing buildings within an historic district 

or located within the Downtown Boundary Area: five hundred dollars. 

5. All demolition permit fees received by the city are to be deposited in the 

historic preservation incentives fund established by SMC 07.08.152.  

 

https://my.spokanecity.org/smc/?Section=07.08.152


 

 

 

E. Fencing. 

1. The permit fee is twenty dollars per one hundred linear feet, or fraction 

thereof. 

2. The processing fee and review fee is twenty-five dollars.  

F. Grading. 

1. Grading permit fees are as follow:  

VOLUME 

(in cubic yards) 

FEE 

(in dollars) 

100 or less 

28.00 

101 - 1,000 

28.00 plus 12.00 for each 100 over 100 

1,001 - 10,000 

136.00 plus 10.00 for each 1,000 over 1,000 

10,001 - 100,000 

226.00 plus 45.00 for each 10,000 over 10,000 

100,001 and more 

631.00 plus 25.00 for each 10,000 over 100,000 

 

2. Grading plan review fees are as follow: 

VOLUME 

(in cubic yards) 

FEE 

(in dollars) 

50 or less 

None 

51 - 100 



 

 

20.00 

101 - 1,000 

25.00 

1,001 - 10,000 

35.00 

10,001 - 100,000 

35.00 plus 17.00 for each 10,000 over 10,000 

100,001 - 200,000 

188.00 plus 10.00 for each 10,000 over 100,000 

200,001 and more 

288.00 plus 5.00 for each 10,000 over 200,000 

  

G.  

3. Failure to obtain a grading permit is a class one infraction under SMC 

1.05.150. 

4. The processing fee is twenty-five dollars.  

H. Sign Permits. 

1. Sign permit fees are: 

a. thirty dollars for each wall sign, projecting sign and incidental sign; 

or 

b. seventy-five dollars for each pole sign, including billboards and off-

premises signs. 

2. The building services plan review fee is fifty dollars and is in addition to 

the sign permit fee for pole signs in excess of one hundred square feet or 

more than thirty feet high. 

3. The planning services review fee is fifty dollars for all signs. 

4. The processing fee is twenty-five dollars.  

I. Factory-built Housing. 

1. The installation fee for factory-built housing is fifty dollars per section. 

2. A foundation or basement requires a separate building permit. 

3. Decks, carports and garages require a separate building permit. 

https://my.spokanecity.org/smc/?Section=01.05.150
https://my.spokanecity.org/smc/?Section=01.05.150


 

 

4. The development services review fee is fifty dollars. 

5. The processing fee is twenty-five dollars.  

J. Manufactured (Mobile) Home. 

1. The installation fee for a manufactured (mobile) home is fifty dollars per 

section. 

2. A basement requires a separate building permit. 

3. Decks, carports and garages require a separate building permit. 

4. The development services review fee is fifty dollars. 

5. The processing fee is twenty-five dollars.  

K. Temporary Structures. 

Permit fees for temporary structures are: 

1. One hundred dollars for the first one hundred eighty days; and 

2. Five hundred dollars for the second one hundred eighty days. 

3. No third session will be allowed. 

4. The development services review fee is fifty dollars. 

5. The processing fee is twenty-five dollars.  

L. Relocation. 

1. The fee for a building relocation inspection for bond determination is 

seventy-five dollars. 

2. The development services review fee is fifty dollars. 

3. The processing fee is twenty-five dollars. 

4. Any repairs or alterations required for relocation are handled by various 

building permits and the fees for such building permits are in addition to the 

relocation permit fee. 

M. Early Start and Fast Track Approval. 

The fee for an early start or fast track building permit approval is twenty-five 

percent of the building permit fee rounded to the next whole dollar amount and is 

in addition to any other required fees. 

N. Certificate of Occupancy. 

1. There is no separate fee for the issuance of a certificate of occupancy 

following final inspection under a permit so long as the fee for the permit is at 

least fifty dollars; otherwise, the minimum fee for a building permit and 

certificate of occupancy is fifty dollars plus a twenty-five dollar processing fee. 



 

 

2. The fees for the issuance of a certificate of occupancy not resulting from 

work done under permit are as provided in SMC 8.02.060. 

3. The building official will assess a fee not to exceed one hundred percent 

of the building permit fee for the issuance or extension of any temporary 

certificate of occupancy. The minimum fee will be: 

a. two hundred twenty-five dollars plus a twenty-five dollar processing 

fee when the building permit fee exceeds this amount; 

b. equal to the amount of the building permit fee when the building 

permit fee is less than two hundred fifty dollars. 

O. Swimming Pools. 

1. The building and plumbing permit fee for a swimming pool is: 

a. seventy-five dollars for those accessory to a single-family 

residence; and 

b. one hundred dollars for all others. 

2. The planning services review fee is twenty-five dollars. 

3. The processing fee is twenty-five dollars. 

4. Mechanical, electrical and fence permits are additional.  

P. Parking Lot and Site Work Permits. 

The fee for a site work permit is charged in accordance with the fee table in 

subsection (A) of this section. 

Q. Reinspections. 

The fee for reinspections for work that was not ready, or corrections previously 

identified but remain uncorrected, or site not accessible is seventy-five dollars 

per incident. 

R. Inspections Outside Normal Inspector Working Hours. 

The fee for inspections outside normal inspector working hours is seventy-five 

dollars per hour or fraction of an hour. A minimum of two hours is payable at the 

time the request is made and before an inspection can be scheduled.  

S. Work Done Without a Permit/Investigation Fees. 

Where work has commenced without first obtaining the required permit(s), a work 

without permit fee equivalent to the greater of: 

1. twice the inspection fee, or 

2. the permit fee plus one hundred fifty dollars, 

must be paid prior to the issuance of the permit(s).  

https://my.spokanecity.org/smc/?Section=08.02.060


 

 

T. Safety Inspections. 

The fees for safety inspections are: 

1. Commercial Buildings:  Seventy-five dollars per hour or fraction of an hour 

with a prepaid minimum of one hundred fifty dollars. 

2. Single-family Residence – Electrical only:  Seventy-five dollars. 

3. Single-family Residence – Two or more trade categories:  One hundred 

fifty dollars. 

4. Two-family Residence:  One hundred seventy-five dollars. 

5. Multifamily – Three to six units:  Two hundred fifty dollars. 

6. Multifamily – Seven to fifty units:  Two hundred fifty dollars plus twenty-five 

dollars for each unit over six. 

7. Multifamily – Over fifty units:  One thousand three hundred fifty dollars 

plus ten dollars for every unit over fifty. 

8. Electrical Service Reconnect - Residence - Twenty-five dollars 

9. Electrical Service Reconnect - Commercial - Fifty dollars 

10. Processing fee:  Twenty-five dollars.  

U. Recording Fee Use of Public Right-of-way and Large Accessory Building 

Agreement. 

The property owner shall be charged a pass-through fee equal to the amount 

assessed by Spokane County when erecting a fence, retaining wall or other 

structure in a public right-of-way. This is a recording fee for the acknowledged 

agreement whereby the property owner covenants to remove the encroachment 

upon notice by the City. An additional twenty-five dollar processing fee is 

required when a permit is not issued in conjunction with the recording. 

V. Expired Permits Over Six Months. 

1. Building Permits. 

a. No inspections have been made:  Permits require full resubmittal, 

and if a commercial project, plan review. Original valuation shall be 

contained in description of new permit. 

b. Footings and foundations only have been inspected and 

approved:  Minimum of seventy-five percent of the original 

assessed permit fee plus new processing fees. Original valuation 

shall be contained in description of new permit. 



 

 

c. All rough-in inspections approved:  Minimum of twenty-five percent 

of original permit fee plus new processing fees. Original valuation 

shall be contained in description of new permit. 

d. Additional work done not on original permit:  New valuation shall be 

calculated based upon either square footage if new construction, or 

valuation if remodel. 

2. Plumbing Permits. 

a. No inspections:  A full new permit for all fixtures is required. 

b. Partial inspections approved:  If water tests, top outs and ground 

plumbing have been approved, then twenty-five percent of the 

original itemized permit fees plus new processing fee. 

3. Mechanical Permits. 

a. No inspections:  A full new permit is required. 

b. Partial inspections:  If all rough-in inspections and air tests have 

been approved, then twenty-five percent of the original permit fee 

plus new processing fee. 

4. Electrical Permit. 

a. No inspections:  A full new permit is required. 

b. Partial inspections:  If all rough-in inspections and service 

inspections have been approved, then twenty-five percent of the 

original fees plus new processing fee. 

W. Processing Fee. 

In addition to all of the fees identified in SMC 8.02.031, the processing fee for 

each permit is twenty-five dollars, unless specifically stated otherwise. 

 

Section 2. That SMC 10.29.030 is amended to read as follows:  

Section 10.29.030 Heating Mechanics – License 

 

No person may perform work requiring a mechanical permit without a license issued by 

the building services department of the appropriate type as follows:  

((A.))((An apprentice heating mechanic license authorizes the holder to do gas fitting 

and oil burner work in the presence and under the supervision of a licensed 

heating mechanic or oil burner installer.))  

  

https://my.spokanecity.org/smc/?Section=08.02.031


 

 

((B))A. A gas heating mechanic I license authorizes the holder to do gas fitting work 

on a gas:  

1. system or gas appliance utilizing up to four hundred thousand BTU input 

per hour, or  

2. appliance in excess of four hundred thousand BTU input per hour under 

the direct supervision and in the presence of a gas heating mechanic II. 

  

((C))B. A gas heating mechanic II license authorizes the holder to do industrial gas 

fitting work (exceeding four hundred thousand BTU) on any permit a mechanical 

contractor can take out. 

  

((D.))((An oil burner installer’s license authorizes the holder to do any installation or 

service work respecting oil burners and oil burning equipment.))  

 

((E))C. Contractors who obtain permits requiring a heating mechanics license and 

the installer who performs the installation shall both be liable for the civil 

infraction set forth in SMC 1.05.170. 

 

Section 3. That SMC 11.19.720 is amended to reach as follows: 

Section 11.19.720 Building Official 

 

A. The director of building services, who has jurisdiction over the construction, 
alteration, repair and occupancy of buildings under the various building and 
construction codes in this title, has responsibility to enforce the zoning code, 
through the permit and certificate processes and through the initiation of legal or 
administrative proceedings. 
  

B. The building official administers the more technical construction aspects of the 
zoning code, such as:  

1. the material and method of installation of manufactured home skirting; 

2. the installation and anchorage of manufactured homes; 

3. waiver of the minimum height of a loading space; and 

4. determination of the costs of restoration of a damaged nonconforming 
building. 
  

http://my.spokanecity.org/smc/?Section=01.05.170


 

 

C. The building official issues certificates of occupancy evidencing the determination 
that the building and use either comply with zoning code or are nonconforming. 
  

D. The building official determines whether and when nonconforming rights have 
been abandoned and requires the discontinuance or removal of unpermitted 
uses. 
  

E. The building official is responsible for various interpretations, including:  

1. which is the front property line; 

2. the permissible height of structures in the airport hazard area; 

3. the number of off-street parking spaces when not specifically provided for; 
and 

4. the propriety of accessory buildings on a side property line. 
  

F. The building official makes recommendations to the director of planning services 
concerning the compliance of a proposal with the goals and policies of an interim 
development control area. 
  

G. In issuing building permits for construction within planned unit developments, the 
building official may permit minor adjustments of the location or dimensions of 
buildings, so long as such adjustments do not:  

1. exceed the permitted density or the total number of dwelling units 
authorized in the PUD, or 

2. decrease the amount of parking facilities, or 

3. permit buildings to be located closer to the site boundary line, or 

4. change any points of ingress or egress to the site. 
Questions as to whether the adjustment is minor in nature may be referred to the 
director of planning services for a decision. 

H. The building official shall review and approve all proposed amendments to Title 
17F Construction Standards prior to review by other recommending or decision 
making bodies within the City of Spokane.   

 

Section 4. That SMC 17C.110.230 is amended to reach as follows: 

Section 17C.110.230 Fences  

A. Purpose.  

The fence standards promote the positive benefits of fences without negatively 
affecting the community or endangering public or vehicle safety. Fences can create 
a sense of privacy, protect children and pets, provide separation from busy streets, 

https://my.spokanecity.org/smc/?Title=17F


 

 

and enhance the appearance of property by providing attractive landscape 
materials. The negative effects of fences can include the creation of street walls that 
inhibit police and community surveillance, decrease the sense of community, hinder 
emergency access and the safe movement of pedestrians and vehicles, and create 
an unattractive appearance. 

B. Types of Fences. 

The standards apply to walls, fences, trellises, arbors, and screens of all types 
whether open, solid, wood, metal, wire, masonry, or other material. 

C. Location.  

1. Front Lot Line. 

Fences up to forty-two inches high are allowed in required front lot line setbacks.  

2. Sides and Rear Lot Line. 

Fences up to six feet high are allowed in required sides or rear lot line setbacks. 
Except in an instance where a rear lot line joins the front lot line of another lot, 
the fence must be either:  

a. forty-two inches high or less, or  

b. right isosceles triangle having sides of seven feet measured along the 
right-of-way line of a side yard and the front property line.  

3. Other. 

The height for fences that are not in required building setbacks is the same as 
the height limits of the zone for detached accessory structures in Table    
17C.110-3.  

4. Alleys. 

Fences shall not obstruct the clear width required in SMC 17H.010.130(G).  

D. Reference to Other Standards. 

Building permits are required by the building services department for all fences 
including the replacement of existing fences. A permit is not required to repair an 
existing fence. 

E. Prohibited Fences.  



 

 

 

1. No person may erect or maintain a fence or barrier consisting of or containing 
barbed, Constantine, or razor wire in the RSF, RTF, RMF, or RHD zones. In 
the RA zone, up to three strands of barbed wire are allowed for agricultural, 
farming or animal uses.  

2. No person may construct or maintain a fence or barrier charged with 
electricity in the RSF, RTF, RMF, or RHD zones. In the RA zone, the use is 
permitted for the containment of livestock only.  

3. A fence, wall, or other structure shall not be placed within the public right-of-
way without an approved covenant as provided in SMC 17G.010.160 and any 
such structure is subject to the height requirement for the adjoining setback. 

4. Fence Setbacks.  

a. Arterial Street. 

No fence may be closer than twelve feet to the curb of an arterial street.  

b. Local Access Street. 

No fence may be closer than the back of the sidewalk on a local access 
street. If there is no sidewalk, the fence shall be setback seven feet behind 
the face of the curb of a local access street. 

F. Enclosures for Pools, Hot Tubs, and Impoundments of Water((or Ponds)).  
1. To protect against potential drowning and near drowning by restricting 
access to pools, spas, and other impoundments of water, a((A)) person 
maintaining a swimming pool, hot tub, pond or other impoundment of water 
exceeding five thousand gallons and eighteen inches or more in depth and 
located on private property is required to construct and maintain an approved 
fence or other barrier as described in the currently adopted edition of the 
International Swimming Pool and Spa Code((by which the pool or other water 
feature is enclosed and inaccessible by small children)).  
2. When a fence is elected as the preferred barrier, the following applies: 

a. The required pool enclosure must be at least fifty-four inches high and 
may be a fence, wall, building or other structure approved by the 
building services department.  

b. If the enclosure is a woven wire fence, it is required to be built to 
discourage climbing. 

c. No opening, except a door or gate, may exceed four inches in any 
dimension.  

d. Any door or gate in the pool enclosure, except when part of the 
occupied dwelling unit, must have self-closing and self-locking 
equipment by which the door or gate is kept secure when not in use. A 
latch or lock release on the outside of the door or gate must be at least 
fifty-four inches above the ground. 



 

 

G. Visibility at Intersections. 

A fence, wall, hedge, or other improvement may not be erected or maintained at 
the corner of a lot so as to obstruct the view of travelers upon the streets.  

1. Subject to the authority of the traffic engineer to make adjustments and 
special requirements in particular cases, all fences, vegetation, and other 
features within the Clear View Triangle defined in SMC 17A.020.030 shall be 
maintained to keep a vertical clear view zone between three and eight feet from 
ground level  

Section 5. That SMC 17F.030.010 is amended to read as follows:  

Section 17F.030.010 Adoption of Standard Codes 

A. Boiler and pressure vessels installed within the city of Spokane shall comply with 
Sections I, II (Parts A, B, C and D), IV, V, VI, VII, VIII Divisions 1, 2, 3, IX, X, XII 
and PVHO-1 of the ASME Boiler and Pressure Vessel Code, current edition, 
together with the addenda thereto. Boilers and pressure vessels shall comply 
with the editions of the code in effect at the time the equipment was 
manufactured. (Reference WAC 296-104-200). 
  

B. The National Board Inspection Code, ((2015))current adopted Edition, with 
current addenda applies to the alteration, inspection and repair of boilers, unfired 
pressure vessels and appurtenances in the city. 
  

C. NFPA 85 Boiler and Combustion Systems Hazards Code current edition (for use 
with boilers with fuel input ratings of twelve million five hundred thousand BTU 
per hour or greater. (Reference WAC 296-104-200) 
  

D. These codes as modified by the additions, deletions and amendments set forth in 
this chapter, are the boiler and pressure vessel code of the City. 
  

E. The basis for SMC 17F.030 is WAC 296-104 with the exclusion of the unique 
administrative and fee items unique to Washington State inspectors and their 
inspection process. 

Section 6. That SMC 17F.040.010 is amended to reach as follows:  

Section 17F.040.010 Adoption of Building Codes and Related Washington State Codes 

A. There is adopted the Washington State Building Code (chapter 19.27 RCW and 
chapter 19.27A RCW) as modified by chapter 51-50 WAC. Specifically, the code 
includes the: 

1. International Building Code (IBC), ((2015))current adopted Edition, as 
published by the International Code Council, including Washington State 

https://my.spokanecity.org/smc/?Chapter=17F.030


 

 

amendments, ICC/ANSI A117.1 ((2009)), and the ((2015))current adopted 
Edition International Existing Building Code; 

2. International Residential Code, ((2015))current adopted Edition (except 
Part IV – Energy Efficiency, Part VII – Plumbing, and Part VIII – Electrical) 
as published by the International Code Council, and chapter 51-51 WAC; 
and Appendix Q: Dwelling Unit Fire Sprinkler Systems, WAC 51-51-
60105;  

3. International Energy Conservation Code, ((2015))current adopted Edition, 
chapter 51-11C and 51-11R WAC.   

B. The codes, standards, and regulations adopted in subsection (A) of this section, 
as amended by this chapter, constitute the building code of the City of Spokane. 

Section 7. That SMC 17F.050.010 is amended to read as follows: 

Section 17F.050.010 Adoption of the National Electrical Code 

 

A. The National Electrical Code, ((2017)) current adopted Edition, as published by 

the National Fire Protection Association, is the electrical code for the City. 

B. The rules and regulations of the State department of labor and industries, 

contained in chapter 296-46B WAC (except WAC 296-46B-906, WAC 296- 46B-

907, WAC 296-46B-908, WAC 296-46B-909, and WAC 296-46B- 911) are 

adopted as amendments and interpretations of the National Electrical Code. 

C. Persons doing electrical work are also required to comply with the state electrical 

installations laws. 

D. The National Electrical Code is further modified by the local amendments as 

provided in this chapter. 

Section 8. That SMC 17F.060.040 is amended to read as follows: 

Section 17F.060.040 Requirements 

A. All new and existing elevators, dumb waiters, escalators, stair climbers, platform 
lifts, temporary personnel hoists, material lifts and moving walks and alterations 
must conform to this code. 

B. A sidewalk elevator, or hoist, or a freight elevator, which does not rise above the 
ground floor must have doors and gates so constructed that the car cannot move 
until they are closed. A sidewalk hoist must be equipped with safety rods so that it 
cannot be started until the sidewalk doors are open. 

C. Lock boxes for machine room access may be required by conditions. 



 

 

D. Conveyances with uncorrected deficiencies are subject to additional inspections 
and fees. An elevator inspector may revoke an operating permit and red-tag the 
conveyance if deficiencies remain uncorrected for one hundred fifty days. 

E. Elevators no longer used or deemed to be unsafe may be ordered to be 
decommissioned by the City Inspector. 

F. Conveyances to be decommissioned must occur by permit and inspections 
according to the requirements of ASME 17.1. Failure to decommission a 
conveyance as directed by the elevator inspector shall result in a class I civil 
infraction. 

G. Elevators incorporating noncircular elastomeric coated steel suspension members 
(belt suspension) shall use only fire rated belts tested to UL 62,  UL 1581 FT-1 fire 
rating or equivalent. 

Section 9. That SMC 17F.060.060 is amended to read as follows:  

Section 17F.060.060 Dangerous Conveyances 

H. Whenever the elevator inspector finds a conveyance or part dangerous or 
unsafe, the owner must immediately repair, replace or otherwise correct the 
danger. 
  

I. No person may:  

1. remove, conceal or deface any notice of condemnation posted on a 
conveyance by the inspector; or  

2. operate a conveyance until it has been inspected and approved for 
operation by the inspector.  

3.   remove any lock or lock out device that has been placed on a conveyance 
by an authorized person that is intended to prevent the operation of the 
conveyance that has been deemed unsafe to operate by that person. 

C.   Violation of this section will result in a Class I civil infraction assessed daily until 
corrected.    

 

Section 10. That SMC 17F.080.010 is amended to read as follows: 

Section 17F.080.010 Adoption of Internal Fire Code 

A. The Washington State current amended edition ((amended version)) of the 
((2015)) International Fire Code (IFC) and related standards, published by the 
International Code Council, as modified by this title, is the fire code of the City of 
Spokane except as otherwise provided. 

B. The following amendments are made to the International Fire Code: 
1. Section 101.1 is modified to read as follows: 



 

 

a. Title. 
These regulations shall be known as the fire code of the City of 
Spokane, hereinafter referred to as “this code.” 

2. Section 109.4 is modified to read as follows: 
a. Violation Penalties. 

Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or shall fail to 
comply with any of the requirements, thereof, or who shall erect, 
install, alter, repair, or do work in violation of the approved 
construction documents or directive of the fire code official or of a 
permit or certificate used under provisions of this code shall be 
subject to the provisions of chapter 1.05 SMC. 

3. Section 111.4 is modified to read as follows: 
a. Failure to Comply. 

Any person who shall continue any work after having been served 
with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed 
to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be 
subject to penalties identified in chapter 1.05 SMC. 

4. IFC Sections 503.1.1, 503.1.2, 503.1.3, 503.2, 503.3, and 503.4 are 
adopted as published. 

5. Chapter 56 is amended with chapter 10.33A SMC. 
6. Section 903.2.11.5 is revised to read: 

a. A wet chemical suppression system shall be installed in a 
commercial kitchen exhaust hood and duct system to meet the 
compliance of Section 904. 

7. Section 904.2.2 is revised to read: 
a. Each required commercial kitchen exhaust hood and duct system 

required by Section 609 to have a Type 1 hood shall be protected 
with a wet chemical suppression system installed in accordance 
with this code. 

8. Section 904.12. 
Replace the first paragraph and the five types to read: 

a. 904.12 – Commercial Cooking Systems. 
The automatic fire extinguishing system for commercial cooking 
systems shall be a wet-chemical type system. The wet-chemical 
system shall be tested in accordance with UL 300 and listed and 
labeled for the intended application. The system shall be installed in 
accordance with this code, its listing, and the manufacturer’s 
installation instructions. Wet-chemical extinguishing systems shall 
be installed in accordance with NFPA 17A. 

9. Section 904.12 – Exception; Section 904.12.1 – Exception; Section 
904.12.3; Section 904.112.4 are not adopted. 

10. Section 905.1 – Add the following to end of the paragraph: 
Class II and Class III standpipes are not allowed for new construction in 
the City of Spokane. All requirements for Class II and Class III shall be 
Class I and references to one- and one-half inch outlets shall be changed 

https://my.spokanecity.org/smc/?Chapter=01.05
https://my.spokanecity.org/smc/?Chapter=01.05
https://my.spokanecity.org/smc/?Chapter=10.33A


 

 

to two and one-half inches. There are no requirements for two and one-
half inch hose to be provided (i.e., stages). 

11. 906.1.1. 
Revise exception to read as follows: 

a. Exception. 
Portable fire extinguishers are not required for residential buildings 
that do not have an interior or exterior common space, such as 
townhouses. 

12. Section 1011.14. 
Remove “and for access to unoccupied roofs” from last sentence. 

13. Section 1011.12 
Remove the last sentence 

14. Section 1023.9. 
Revise the second sentence to read as follows: 
“. . . the story of, the number of floors above grade (if it is different from the 
story number), and the direction . . .” 

15. Section 5704.2.9.6.1. 
Remove the last part of the last sentence “(See Section 3 of the Sample 
Ordinance for Adoption of the International Fire Code on page xxi).” 

16. Section 5706.2.4.4. 
Remove the last part of the last sentence “(See Section 3 of the Sample 
Ordinance for Adoption of the International Fire Code on page xxi).” 

17. Section 5806.2. 
Remove the last part of the last sentence “(See Section 3 of the Sample 
Ordinance for Adoption of the International Fire Code on page xxi).” 

18. Section 6104.2. 
Remove the last part of the last sentence “(See Section 3 of the Sample 
Ordinance for Adoption of the International Fire Code on page xxi).” 

Section 11. That SMC 17F.090.010 is amended to read as follows:  

Section 17F.090.010 Adoption of International Mechanical Code 

 

The current adopted Editions of the International Mechanical Code (IMC) and the 

International Fuel Gas Code (IFGC)((, 2015 Editions,)) published by the International 

Code Council, as modified by chapter 51-52 WAC and the additions, deletions, and 

amendments set forth in this chapter, are the mechanical code of the City. 

 

Section 12. That SMC 17F.100.010 is amended to read as follows:  

Section 17F.100.010 Adoption of Uniform Plumbing Code 

A. The Uniform Plumbing Code (UPC), ((2015))current adopted Edition, and related 
standards published by the International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical 



 

 

Officials, as modified by chapter 51-56 WAC and the additions, deletions, and 
amendments set forth in this chapter, is the plumbing code of the City. 

B. Portions of the UPC not adopted are: 
1. Chapters 12 and 15; 
2. Combustion air and venting of appliances in Chapter 5; and 
3. Portions of the Code addressing building sewers. 

C. Appendices A, B, and I of the UPC are adopted as part of the code. 

Section 13. That SMC 17G.010.200 is amended to reach as follows:  

Section 17G.010.200 Application for Worker’s License 

 

A. State Licenses, Permits, Certificates. 

Electricians and electrical apprentices are certificated by the department of labor 

and industries under chapter 19.28 RCW. Persons engaged in the craft of 

installing, altering, repairing and renovating potable water systems and liquid 

waste systems within a building, either as a journeyman plumber or specialty 

plumber must have a certificate issued by the department of labor and industries 

as provided in chapter 18.106 RCW. 

  

B. Boiler Operators’ and Boiler Inspectors’ Licenses.  

1. An applicant for a license under the boiler and pressure vessel code shall 

pay the prescribed fees and make written application to the department of 

building services on prescribed forms. 

2. Unless the application is to renew a license in good standing for the 

succeeding year, the applicant shall be examined as to his qualifications 

by the board of boiler examiners. 

3. To be eligible to apply for a license, an applicant must meet the following 

minimum qualifications:  

a. First class engineer and boiler inspector:  Two years of practical 

experience as a boiler operator in a high-pressure plant exceeding 

eight million BTU input. 

b. Second class engineer:  One year of practical experience as a 

high-pressure boiler operator in a high-pressure plant exceeding 

four million BTU input. 

c. Third class engineer:  One year of practical experience. 

d. Small high-pressure boiler operator:  Must pass the prescribed 

examination. 



 

 

e. Low-pressure boiler operator:  Must pass the prescribed 

examination. 

4. All boiler operation and boiler inspector license holders must renew the 

license annually by December 31st. 

  

C. Mechanics’ Licenses.  

1. An applicant for any license to do work under the mechanical code shall 

pay the prescribed fees and make written application to the department of 

building services on prescribed forms. 

2. The board of gas heating mechanic examiners shall examine to determine 

the qualifications and fitness of original applicants for licenses as a gas 

heating mechanic((, oil burner installer, gas inspector or oil inspector)). 

The board may similarly examine any applicant for a renewal of such 

license. 

3. To be eligible to apply for a license, an applicant must meet the following 

minimum qualifications:  

a. Gas heating mechanic I or gas inspector I:(( Successful completion 

of the Inland Northwest HVAC Association Gas School or three 

years’ experience in gas fitting work or gas service)) No 

Requirements. 

b. Gas heating mechanic II or gas inspector II:(( Successful 

completion of an industrial gas school or three years’ experience in 

gas fitting work, other than as an apprentice))Must possess an 

active Gas Mechanic I license. 

4. “Gas fitting work” means the installation, alteration, extension, repair or 

maintenance, from the outlet of the gas meter, of gas piping, venting and 

appliances. 

5. All mechanical license holders must renew the license annually by 

December 31st. If the license is expired for more than 90 days, a new 

application and exam is required. 

  

D. Apprentices. 

The building official, with the approval of the appropriate board, may promulgate 

from time to time rules for the licensing, registration or regulation or apprentices 

in the various trades, consistent with federal and state law. 

  



 

 

E. Registered Servicers. 

An applicant for a license to test, maintain and alter fire alarm systems, portable 

fire extinguishers, range hood systems, sprinkler systems, standpipe systems, or 

underground critical materials storage tanks must pay the prescribed fee and 

make written application to the fire official. Proof of competency is by exam, 

demonstration, or submittal of credentials as approved by the fire official. 

  

F. Refueler Operator. 

An applicant for a permit to operate an aircraft refueler vehicle must present to 

the fire official an identification card issued by his employer certifying the 

applicant’s qualifications, as provided in UFC Section 2402.3. 

 


