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CITY COUNCIL BRIEFING SESSION 
 
Council will adopt the Administrative Session Consent Agenda after they have had appropriate 
discussion. Items may be moved to the 6:00 p.m. Legislative Session for formal consideration by the 
Council at the request of any Council Member. 

SPOKANE CITY COUNCIL BRIEFING SESSIONS (BEGINNING AT 3:30 P.M. EACH MONDAY) AND LEGISLATIVE 
SESSIONS (BEGINNING AT 6:00 P.M. EACH MONDAY) ARE BROADCAST LIVE ON CITY CABLE CHANNEL FIVE 
AND STREAMED LIVE ON THE CHANNEL FIVE WEBSITE. THE SESSIONS ARE REPLAYED ON CHANNEL FIVE 
ON WEDNESDAYS AT 6:00 P.M. AND FRIDAYS AT 10:00 A.M. 

The Briefing Session is open to the public, but will be a workshop meeting. Discussion will be limited 
to Council Members and appropriate Staff and Counsel. There will be an opportunity for the expression 
of public views on any issue not relating to the Current or Advance Agendas during the Open Forum at 
the beginning and the conclusion of the Legislative Agenda. 
ADDRESSING THE COUNCIL 

 No one may speak without first being recognized for that purpose by the Chair. 
Except for named parties to an adjudicative hearing, a person may be required to 
sign a sign-up sheet as a condition of recognition. 

 Each person speaking at the public microphone shall print his or her name and 
address on the sheet provided at the podium and verbally identify him/herself by 
name, address and, if appropriate, representative capacity. 

 If you are submitting letters or documents to the Council Members, please provide 
a minimum of ten copies via the City Clerk. The City Clerk is responsible for 
officially filing and distributing your submittal. 

 In order that evidence and expressions of opinion be included in the record and 
that decorum befitting a deliberative process be maintained, modes of expression 
such as demonstration, banners, applause and the like will not be permitted. 

 A speaker asserting a statement of fact may be asked to document and identify 
the source of the factual datum being asserted. 

SPEAKING TIME LIMITS:  Unless deemed otherwise by the Chair, each person addressing the 
Council shall be limited to a three-minute speaking time. 
CITY COUNCIL AGENDA:   The City Council Advance and Current Agendas may be obtained prior to 
Council Meetings from the Office of the City Clerk during regular business hours (8 a.m. - 5 p.m.). The Agenda 
may also be accessed on the City website at www.spokanecity.org. Agenda items are available for public review 
in the Office of the City Clerk during regular business hours. 
AMERICANS WITH DISABILITIES ACT (ADA) INFORMATION: The City of Spokane is committed 
to providing equal access to its facilities, programs and services for persons with disabilities. The Spokane City 
Council Chamber in the lower level of Spokane City Hall, 808 W. Spokane Falls Blvd., is wheelchair accessible and 
also is equipped with an infrared assistive listening system for persons with hearing loss. Headsets may be checked 
out (upon presentation of picture I.D.) at the City Cable 5 Production Booth located on the First Floor of the Municipal 
Building, directly above the Chase Gallery or through the meeting organizer. Individuals requesting reasonable 
accommodations or further information may call, write, or email Gita George-Hatcher at (509) 625-7083, 808 W. 
Spokane Falls Blvd, Spokane, WA, 99201; or ggeorge-hatcher@spokanecity.org. Persons who are deaf or hard of 
hearing may contact Ms. George-Hatcher at (509) 625-7083 through the Washington Relay Service at 7-1-1. Please 
contact us forty-eight (48) hours before the meeting date. 

 
If you have questions, please call the Agenda Hotline at 625-6350.  

mailto:ggeorge-hatcher@spokanecity.org
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BRIEFING SESSION 
(3:30 p.m.) 

(Council Chambers Lower Level of City Hall) 
(No Public Testimony Taken) 

 
Council Reports 
 
Staff Reports 
 
Committee Reports 
 
Advance Agenda Review 
 
Current Agenda Review 
 

 
 

ADMINISTRATIVE SESSION 
 
Roll Call of Council 
 
 

CONSENT AGENDA 
 
REPORTS, CONTRACTS AND CLAIMS RECOMMENDATION 
  

1.  Increase administrative reserve on contract with 
Halme Construction, Inc. (Davenport, WA) for Lower 
Hollywood Sewer Replacement—increase of $22,000 
for a total administrative reserve of $41,589.20, or 
21.2% of the contract price. 
 

Approve PRO 2012-0042 
ENG 2010103 

2.  Contract with Kemira Water Solutions (Spokane, WA) 
for an estimated 5,000 tons, more or less, of Aluminum 
Sulfate for use at the Riverside Park Water 
Reclamation Facility for phosphorus removal—
estimated expense $1,212,005 (including tax). 
 

Approve & 
Authorize 
Contract 

OPR 2013-0213 
BID 3902-13 

3.  Loan Agreement with Washington State Public Works 
Board for pre-construction of Plains System Second 
Reservoir—$300,000. 
 

Approve OPR 2013-0214 

4.  Memorandum of Understanding with the University 
District Public Development Authority (UDPDA) to 
provide a process and framework for the UDPDA to 
prioritize redevelopment projects to be completed 

Approve OPR 2013-0215 

ngoes
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within the Spokane University District Revitalization 
Area, and to put together a corresponding work plan to 
support such projects. 
 

5.  Setting public hearing before City Council for April 15, 
2013, regarding moratorium on the establishment of 
medical cannabis collective gardens and licensed 
dispensaries as set forth in Ordinance No. C34968. 
 

Set Hrg. 
4/15/13 

ORD C34968 

6.  Report of the Mayor of pending:  
 
a. Claims and payments of previously approved 

obligations, including those of Parks and Library, 
through __________, total $_________, with Parks 
and Library claims approved by their respective 
boards. Warrants excluding Parks and Library total 
$_________. 
 

b. Payroll claims of previously approved obligations 
through ____________: $___________. 

 

Approve & 
Authorize 
Payments 

 
 

CPR 2013-0002 
 
 
 
 
 
 

CPR 2013-0003 

 
 

 

EXECUTIVE SESSION 
(Closed Session of Council) 

(Executive Session may be held or reconvened during the 6:00 p.m. Legislative Session) 
 

 
 

CITY COUNCIL SESSION 
(May be held or reconvened following the 3:30 p.m. Administrative Session) 

(Council Briefing Center) 
 
This session may be held for the purpose of City Council meeting with Mayoral 
nominees to Boards and/or Commissions. The session is open to the public. 
 

 
 

TOWN HALL SESSION 
(6:00 P.M.) 

(Council Reconvenes at East Central Community Center)  
(500 South Stone Street) 

 
WORDS OF INSPIRATION 
 

ngoes
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PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 
 
ROLL CALL OF COUNCIL 
 
ANNOUNCEMENTS 
(Announcements regarding Changes to the City Council Agenda) 
 
BOARDS AND COMMISSIONS APPOINTMENTS 
(Includes Announcements of Boards and Commissions Vacancies) 
 
CITY ADMINISTRATION REPORT 
 

 
 

COUNCIL COMMITTEE REPORTS 
(Committee Reports for Finance, Neighborhoods, Public Safety, Public Works, and 
Planning/Community and Economic Development Committees and other Boards and Commissions) 
 

 
 

TOWN HALL FORUM 
This is an opportunity for citizens to discuss items of interest not relating to the Current or Advance 
Agendas nor relating to political campaigns/items on upcoming election ballots. This Forum shall be 
for a period of time not to exceed thirty minutes. After all the matters on the Agenda have been acted 
on, unless it is 10:00 p.m. or later, the open forum shall continue for a period of time not to exceed 
thirty minutes. Each speaker will be limited to three minutes, unless otherwise deemed by the Chair. 
If you wish to speak at the forum, please sign up on the sign-up sheet located in the Chase Gallery. 
 

 
 

LEGISLATIVE AGENDA 
 

NO EMERGENCY BUDGET ORDINANCES 
 

NO EMERGENCY ORDINANCES 
 

RESOLUTIONS  
(Require Four Affirmative, Recorded Roll Call Votes) 

 
RES 2013-0023 
 

Declaring Community Detox Services 501(c)(3) (Spokane, WA) a sole 
source for emergency service van patrol to transport publicly 
intoxicated individuals—not to exceed $200,000 in a two-year span. 
 

RES 2013-0024 
 

Amending the City of Spokane Sustainability Action Plan. 
 
 

 

ngoes
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NO FINAL READING ORDINANCES 
 

NO FIRST READING ORDINANCES 
 

 
 

NO SPECIAL CONSIDERATIONS  
 

 
 

NO HEARINGS  
 

 
 

NEIGHBORHOOD REPORTS 
 

 
 

Motion to Approve Advance Agenda for March 25, 2013 
(per Council Rule 2.1.2) 

 
 

 
TOWN HALL FORUM (CONTINUED) 

This is an opportunity for citizens to discuss items of interest not relating to the Current or Advance 
Agendas nor relating to political campaigns/items on upcoming election ballots. This Forum shall be 
for a period of time not to exceed thirty minutes. After all the matters on the Agenda have been acted 
on, unless it is 10:00 p.m. or later, the open forum shall continue for a period of time not to exceed 
thirty minutes. Each speaker will be limited to three minutes, unless otherwise deemed by the Chair. 
If you wish to speak at the forum, please sign up on the sign-up sheet located in the Chase Gallery. 
 
ADJOURNMENT 
The March 25, 2013, Regular Legislative Session of the City Council is adjourned to 
Monday, Monday, April 8, 2013. 
 
Note: The regularly scheduled City Council meeting for Monday, April 1, 2013, has 
been canceled. 
 

NOTES 
 



Agenda Sheet for City Council Meeting of: 
03/25/2013  

Date Rec’d 3/13/2013 

Clerk’s File # PRO 2012-0042 

Renews #  

Submitting Dept ENGINEERING SERVICES Cross Ref #  

Contact Name/Phone KEN BROWN 625-7727 Project # 2010103 

Contact E-Mail KBROWN@SPOKANECITY.ORG Bid #  

Agenda Item Type Contract Item Requisition # CR 13288 

Agenda Item Name 0370-ADMIN RESERVE INCREASE - LOWER HOLLYWOOD 

Agenda Wording 

Authorization to increase the administrative reserve on the contract with Halme Construction, Inc., for Lower 

Hollywood Sewer Replacement - for an increase of $22,000.00 for a total administrative reserve of $41,589.20 

or 21.2% of the contract price. 

Summary (Background) 

This project is located in a sensitive area in the hillside above the Riverside Park Water Reclamation Facility 

within State Park land.  Cost increases exceeded the authorized administrative reserve. Therefore, it will be 

necessary to increase the administrative reserve an additional $22,000.00 or 11%.  See attached briefing paper 

for more details. 

Fiscal Impact Budget Account 
Expense $ 22,000.00 # 4370 43101 94000 56501 

Select $  #  
Select $  #  
Select $  #  

Approvals Council Notifications 
Dept Head TAYLOR, MIKE Study Session  

Division Director QUINTRALL, JAN Other PCED 3/18/13 

Finance BUSTOS, KIM Distribution List 
Legal BURNS, BARBARA sdecker@spokanecity.org 

For the Mayor SANDERS, THERESA pdolan@spokanecity.org 

Additional Approvals 

mlesesne@spokanecity.org 

Purchasing  rdykes@spokanecity.org 

  mhughes@spokanecity.org 

  kbrooks@spokanecity.org 

  htrautman@spokanecity.org 

  



 
BRIEFING PAPER 

Department of Engineering Services 
Date: March 7, 2013 

 
 

Subject: 
Lower Hollywood Sewer Relocation project: Request for additional administrative 
reserve. 
 
 
Background: 
This project is located in a sensitive area in the hillside above the Riverside Park 
Water Reclamation Facility within State Park land. 
 
Costs increases for this project exceeded the administrative reserve authorized 
for the project.  Exceptional cost increases were created by three items. 
 

1.  Due to the location of this project we determined that a backup bypass 
system was needed to avoid catastrophic sewer overflow should the 
primary bypass system fail.  Bypass flow exceeded 4000 gallons per 
minute.  The additional cost for the backup system was $5800. 

2. Several unidentified utilities were discovered in the area of the new pipe 
installation causing extra work for the Contractor at an added cost of 
$5500. 

3. The plans called for careful and limited removal of trees and full 
restoration of the affected area of the hillside.  Though the total area of 
tree removal was less than allowed, installation on the hillside greatly 
increased the disturbed area above the amount that was bid. The actual 
area restored with top soil, seed, mulch and fertilizer resulted in a cost 
overrun of $17000. 

 
Impact: 
Original contract amount was $195,892 with administrative reserve of 
$19,589.20.  The additional cost will be paid from Wastewater Management fund. 
 
Action: 
Approval of additional administrative reserve of $22,000 (11%) to make final 
payment for the project. 
 
For further information on this subject contact Mike Taylor, Director of Engineering Services at 
625-6307.  



Agenda Sheet for City Council Meeting of: 
03/25/2013  

Date Rec’d 3/13/2013 

Clerk’s File # OPR 2013-0213 

Renews #  

Submitting Dept WASTEWATER MANAGEMENT Cross Ref #  

Contact Name/Phone DALE ARNOLD 625-7900 Project #  

Contact E-Mail DARNOLD@SPOKANECITY.ORG Bid # 3902-13 

Agenda Item Type Contract Item Requisition # VALUE BLANKET 

Agenda Item Name 4320-ALUMINUM SULFATE BID AWARD/CONTRACT W/KEMIRA 

Agenda Wording 

Contract with Kemira Water Solutions (Spokane, WA) for an estimated 5,000 tons, more or less, of Aluminum 

Sulfate for use at the Riverside Park Water Reclamation Facility (RPWRF)for phosphorus removal.  Estimated 

cost is $1,212,005.00 including tax. 

Summary (Background) 

On February 25, 2013, sealed bids were opened to supply the RPWRF with liquid Aluminum Sulfate.  Results of 

the bid are on the attached tabulation.  Four bids were received, with the lowest from Kemira Water Solutions 

at $223.00 per dry ton.  This will be a one-year contract beginning April 1, 2013 through March 31, 2014, with 

options for four (4) one-year renewals (5/yr maximum).  Cost increases may be considered at time of renewal 

and are subject to the City's approval. 

Fiscal Impact Budget Account 
Expense $ 1,212,005.00 # 4320-43210-35148-53203 

Select $  #  
Select $  #  
Select $  #  

Approvals Council Notifications 
Dept Head ARNOLD, DALE Study Session  

Division Director ROMERO, RICK Other Public Works 3/11/2013 

Finance BUSTOS, KIM Distribution List 
Legal BURNS, BARBARA pdolan@spokanecity.org 

For the Mayor SANDERS, THERESA Tax & Licenses 

Additional Approvals 

emasingale@spokanecity.org 

Purchasing WAHL, CONNIE mlesesne@spokanecity.org 

  cwahl@spokanecity.org 

  kwsna.bids@kemira.com 

  Jane.Bittle@kemira.com 

  



Briefing Paper 
Public Works Committee 

Wastewater Management Department 

March 11, 2013 

 

Subject 
Award of Bid #3902-13 liquid Aluminum Sulfate to Kemira Water Solutions, Inc. for 
approximately 5,000 dry tons of liquid Aluminum Sulfate “alum” at a cost of $223/dry 
ton.  Cost is approximately $1,212,005 more or less including sales tax.  The contract 
period is April 1, 2013 to March 31, 2014. 

 
Background 
Aluminum Sulfate is used to remove Phosphorus from water from the Riverside Park 
Water Reclamation Facility (RPWRF) discharged to the Spokane River.  The RPWRF is 
required to chemically remove Phosphorus from its effluent flow during the algae 
growing season in Lake Spokane. 
The request for bids was sent to 42 companies with four responses and 2 “no bid” 
responses.  The following bids were submitted: 
 
Kemira Water Solutions, Inc.     $223     /dry ton 
Thatcher Company of Montana     $228.90/dry ton 
Rhodia Inc.        $418.50/dry ton 
General Chemical       $435     /dry ton 
 

Impact 
This purchase allows the RPWRF to continue to chemically remove Phosphorus from its 
effluent prior to discharge to the Spokane River as required by its permit. 
 

Action 
Recommend approval 

 

Funding 
The Wastewater Management Department has apportioned an adequate amount in its 
chemical budget to cover the cost of this contract. 
 
 
 
 
 
For more information, please contact Rick Romero, Director of Utilities Division 625-6361 or rromero@spokanecity.org  



 

BID TABULATION 
 

BID #3902-13    LIQUID ALUMINUM SULFATE  

 

DUE:  2/25/2013 

 

 

RESPONSES 

RECEIVED FROM: 

 

GENERAL 

CHEMICAL 

PERFORMANCE 

PRODUCTS, LLC 

90 EAST HALSEY 

ROAD, 
PARSIPPANY, NJ 

07054 

 

KEMIRA WATER 

SOLUCTIONS, INC. 

3211 CLINTON 

PARKWAY COURT 

LAWRENCE, KA 

66047 

 

RHODIA INC. 

8 CEDAR BROOK 

DRIVE 

CRANBURY, NJ 

08512 

 

THATCHER 

COMPANY OF 

MONTANA 

P.O. BOX 27407 

SALT LAKE CITY, 

UT 84127-0407 

 

JCI JONES 

CHEMICAL, INC. 

1919 MARINE VIEW 

DR. 

TACOMA, WA 

98422 

 

UNIVAR USA INC. 

8201 S. 212
TH

 

KENT, WA 98032 

 

5,000 DRY TON  

(MORE OR LESS)  

 

LIQUID ALUMINUM 

SULFATE 

 

 
435.00/dry ton 

 
223.00/dry ton 

 
418.50/dry ton 

 

 
228.9/dry ton 

 
NO BID AT 
THIS TIME 

 
NO BID AT 
THIS TIME 

 

SUBTOTAL 

 

 
$2,175,000.00 

 
$1,115,000.00 

 
$2,092,500.00 

 
$1,144,500.00 

  

 

Sales Tax (8.7%) 
 

$189,225.00 
 

 
$97,005.00 

 
$182,047.50 

 
$99,571.50 

  

 

GRAND TOTAL 
 

$2,364,225.00 
 

$1,212,005.00 
 

 

$2,274.547.50 
 

$1,244,071.50 
  

 

DELIVERY TIME 
 

1-2 DAYS ARO 
 

3-4 DAYS ARO 
 

2-3 DAYS ARO 
 

1-3 BUSINESS 
DAYS ARO 

  

 

Request for Bids sent to 42 companies with 4 responses and 2 “no bid” responses 

 

PLEASE NOTE THAT THIS BID TABULATION IS NOT AN INDICATION OF AWARD 

RECOMMENDATION. CRITERIA, IN ADDITION TO PRICE, ARE EVALUATED TO DETERMINE 

RESPONSIVE BID MEETING SPECIFICATIONS.  AWARD OF BID IS MADE BY CITY COUNCIL. 













































 

 

Agenda Sheet for City Council Meeting of: 
03/25/2013  

Date Rec’d 3/13/2013 

Clerk’s File # OPR 2013-0214 

Renews #  

Submitting Dept ENGINEERING SERVICES Cross Ref #  

Contact Name/Phone MARK PAPICH  625-6310 Project #  

Contact E-Mail MPAPICH@SPOKANECITY.ORG Bid #  

Agenda Item Type Contract Item Requisition #  

Agenda Item Name 0370-LOAN AGREEMENT-PLAINS SYSTEM SECOND RESERVOIR 

Agenda Wording 

Loan Agreement between Washington State Public Works Board and the City for pre-construction of Plains 

System Second Reservoir. 

Summary (Background) 

Loan Agreement for pre-construction work for a new reservoir in the vicinity of Highway 2 and Hayford Road 

in the West Plains. The total project cost(design and construction) is estimated to be $3.83 million. The pre-

construction loan is for $300,000. 

Fiscal Impact Budget Account 

Revenue $ 300,000.00 # 4100 42410 99999 38271 

Select $  #  

Select $  #  

Select $  #  

Approvals Council Notifications 

Dept Head TAYLOR, MIKE Study Session  

Division Director QUINTRALL, JAN Other Public Works 3/11/13 

Finance BUSTOS, KIM Distribution List 

Legal BURNS, BARBARA sdecker@spokanecity.org 

For the Mayor SANDERS, THERESA pdolan@spokanecity.org 

Additional Approvals 

mlesesne@spokanecity.org 

Purchasing  mpapich@spokanecity.org 

  mhughes@spokanecity.org 

  acline@spokanecity.org 

  htrautman@spokanecity.org 

 



BRIEFING PAPER 
Public Works Committee 

Capital Programs 
March 11, 2012 

 
 

Subject: 
Washington State Public Works Board Loan Agreement for Plains System 
Second Reservoir. 
 
Background: 
This project will construct a new reservoir in the vicinity of Highway 2 and 
Hayford Road in the west plains.  An exact location for the tank has not been 
determined. This second reservoir will provide needed storage in the western 
portion of the City’s water service area.  This service area is experiencing periods 
where water pressure is below desired levels.  This loan is for pre-construction 
dollars and will be used to find an exact location for the new tank.  The loan may 
also be used to purchase property for the tank.  The total project cost is 
estimated to be $3.83 million. 
 
Impact: 
The additional storage provided from this project will address the water pressure 
issues in this area. 
 
Action: 
Council Approval of the Public Works Board Loan. 
 
Funding: 
Washington State Public Works Board loan is for the amount of $300,000 at an 
interest rate of 1 percent and a repayment period of 5 years.  The repayment 
period may be extended to 20-years if construction funding is secured by June 1, 
2014. 
 
For further information, please contact Katherine Miller, Principal Engineer of Capital Programs at 625-
6338 or kemiller@spokanecity.org 

























































 

 

Agenda Sheet for City Council Meeting of: 
03/25/2013  

Date Rec’d 3/13/2013 

Clerk’s File # OPR 2013-0215 

Renews #  

Submitting Dept PLANNING SERVICES Cross Ref # ORD C34933 

Contact Name/Phone TAMI PALMQUIST  625-6157 Project #  

Contact E-Mail TPALMQUIST@SPOKANECITY.ORG Bid #  

Agenda Item Type Contract Item Requisition #  

Agenda Item Name 0650-MOU BETWEEN CITY AND UDPDA 

Agenda Wording 

University District Public Development Authority (UDPDA) update on the Memorandum of 

Understanding(MOU)contract 

Summary (Background) 

Mayor and Council created the UDPDA by Ordinance C-34933 on November 5, 2012.  This MOU will provide a 

process and framework for the UDPDA to prioritize redevelopment projects to be completed within the 

Spokane University District Revitalization Area and to put together a corresponding work plan to support such 

projects. It is anticipated this will lead to a future interlocal agreement related to sharing of financial and 

professional resources. The MOU will be approved by the PDA Board March 19. 

Fiscal Impact Budget Account 

Neutral $  #  

Select $  #  

Select $  #  

Select $  #  

Approvals Council Notifications 

Dept Head CHESNEY, SCOTT Study Session  

Division Director QUINTRALL, JAN Other PCED 2/25/13 

Finance BUSTOS, KIM Distribution List 

Legal BURNS, BARBARA sdecker@spokanecity.org 

For the Mayor SANDERS, THERESA tpalmquist@spokanecity.org 

Additional Approvals 

mpiccolo@spokanecity.org 

Purchasing  schesney@spokanecity.org 

  bcorbett@spokanecity.org 

  htrautman@spokanecity.org 

   

 



For further information contact:  Tami Palmquist, Planning & Development, 625-6157 

BRIEFING PAPER 

University District Public Development Authority (UDPDA) 

City of Spokane Planning & Development Department 

February 25, 2013 

 

Subject 

Update on a pending Memorandum of Understanding between the city and University District Public 
Development Authority (UDPDA) that will be coming forward for Council approval.  

 

Purpose 

This MOU will clarify and memorialize the roles and responsibilities of the City and the UDPDA and 
set the framework for the subsequent Interlocal Agreement, Development Strategy and 2013 work 
plan.   

 

Background 

City Council formed the Spokane University District Revitalization Area (UDRA) by Ordinance No. C-
34470 on August 17, 2009.  With the formation of the UDRA a comprehensive project list was 
established for construction with public funds generated by the incremental revenue of growth within 
the UDRA area..  

City Council approved the creation of the University District Public Development Authority, by 
Ordinance No. C-34933 on November 5, 2012, as a development implementation organization to 
manage public redevelopment projects within the University District Revitalization Area.  

The UD PDA held its first meeting on January 8, 2013.  
 
The Planning and Development Department will work with the UDPDA to: 

 Clarify PDA responsibility to direct funds for project activities 
 Clarify city administration of public funds  
 Assess UDRA funding expectations & limitations 
 Create comprehensive “Sources and Uses of Funds” database 
 Confirm city professional staff support – PDS 
 Establish benchmarks for PDA independent responsibilities 
 Establish expectations for UDDA philanthropic & marketing roles 
 Establish development financing/ funding expectations 

 
The UDPDA board will consider action on the MOU at a Special Meeting on March 19, 2013. 

 

Recommendation 

Approve the MOU between the City and the University District Public Development Authority 
(UDPDA) board of directors. This agreement assures that everyone is moving forward with the same 
expectations, agreed upon roles and responsibilities, and everyone understands the next steps of the 
UDPDA.  

A copy of the proposed MOU is attached. 
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A MEMORANDUM OF UNDERSTANDING BETWEEN 
THE CITY OF SPOKANE, WASHINGTON, AND 

THE UNIVERSITY DISTRICT PUBLIC DEVELOPMENT AUTHORITY 

 

 

 This Memorandum of Understanding (this “MOU”) between the City of Spokane, 
Washington (the "City"), a Washington State municipal corporation, and the University 
District Public Development Authority (the "Authority"), an entity created pursuant to 
chapter 35.21 RCW (hereinafter collectively referred to as the “Parties”), is dated this ____ 
day of _______________________, 2013. 

WHEREAS, the City of Spokane is a State of Washington first class charter city 
organized and existing under the Constitution and laws of the State of Washington; and 

WHEREAS, the City Council created the Spokane University District Revitalization 
Area (the “UDRA”) by Ordinance No. C-34470 on August 17, 2009, within the limitations of 
RCW 39.104.050 and in accordance with RCW 39.104.040; and 

WHEREAS, the City is authorized to implement state sales tax credit awarded to the 
UDRA under the State’s Local Revitalization Financing (LRF) program; and  

WHEREAS, the City has imposed a sales and use tax set forth in chapter 8.17 of the 
Spokane Municipal Code and under the authority if RCW 82.14.510 in accordance with the 
terms of RCW chapter 82.14; and 

WHEREAS, the City is authorized by RCW 35.21.730 to create public development 
authorities to (i) administer and execute federal grants or programs, (ii) receive and 
administer private funds, goods or services for any lawful public purpose; (iii) improve 
governmental efficiency and services, (iv) improve the general living conditions in the 
urban areas in and around the City and (v) perform any lawful public purpose or public 
function; and 

WHEREAS, the City Council approved Ordinance No. C-34933 on November 5, 2012, 
creating the University District Public Development Authority, authorized its charter and 
bylaws and established its Board of Directors to govern the affairs of the Authority; and  

WHEREAS, Ordinance C-34933 approved the Charter and Bylaws of the Authority to 
participate in redeveloping real property in and around the UDRA, by acquiring, managing, 
and disposing of real property, securing financing, undertaking or providing for 
redevelopment, and entering into agreements with developers proposing to develop 
projects within the UDRA; and 

WHEREAS, the focus area of the Authority is the area coextensive with UDRA 
established by City Ordinance C-34470 on August 17, 2009. At around 770 acres, the tax 
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increment finance district contains the Riverpoint campus, a downtown location for five 
higher education institutions, the Innovate Washington technology incubator, and home of 
Gonzaga University; and 

WHEREAS, the Mission Statement of the Authority is, “Cultivate an urban, University 
District environment favorable to development and actively engage those projects that 
demonstrate investment readiness.”; and 

WHEREAS, the City recognizes that while it has limited control over the Authority, 
by statute, the City must oversee and control the Authority’s operations and funds in order 
to correct any deficiency and to assure that the purposes of each project are reasonably 
accomplished; and 

WHEREAS, to ensure that the Authority facilitates redevelopment in accordance 
with agreed standards, and that the Parties continue to work together efficiently, 
effectively and in close communication, the Parties desire to set forth objectives, standards 
and decision-making processes for accomplishing these joint goals; and 

WHEREAS, this MOU is intended to set forth the process and framework for 
identifying and planning for the development or acquisition of priority properties; and  

WHEREAS, upon the agreed upon completion of the tasks and obligations under this 
MOU, the Parties anticipate executing a future interlocal agreement that may, among other 
obligations, provide for the financing of the Authorities development activities; and  

 NOW, THEREFORE, be it understood that the Parties agree to undertake the 
following:   

Section 1. Purpose 

The purpose of this agreement is to provide a process and framework for the Authority to 
prioritize redevelopment projects to be completed within the Spokane University District 
Revitalization Area, and to put together a corresponding work plan to support such 
projects.  The Parties anticipate that the mutually acceptable result of this effort will lead to 
a future interlocal agreement related to the sharing of financial and professional resources.   

Section 2. Obligations of the Parties  

 2.1 The Authority shall undertake the following:   

2.1.1 Establish prioritization of potential redevelopment projects that may 
qualify for public improvements funded by Spokane University 
District Revitalization District financing within the University District 
Revitalization Area, as described in Ordinance No. C-34470. 

2.1.2 Create a Development Strategy to govern the Authority's 
redevelopment activities. The Development Strategy shall be 
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consistent with all other applicable city plans including without 
limitation the City’s Comprehensive Plan and local revitalization 
financing plans. 

2.1.3 Adopt a Work Plan in consultation with and accepted by the City, that 
will include processes and plans for the implementation of the 
Development Strategy.  

2.1.4 Develop annual budget allocating projected revenue necessary for the 
implementation and construction of projects authorized under the 
Spokane University District Revitalization District.  

2.2 The City shall undertake the following:  

2.2.1 Provide professional staff and related support as needed to help the 
Authority identify, prioritize and plan the redevelopment and 
infrastructure projects that may be funded through the use of UDRA 
funds.   

2.2.2 Operate in cooperation with the Authority to help create a mutually 
acceptable Development Strategy and Work Program. 

2.3 It is anticipated that the ongoing operation, financing, maintenance and 
ownership responsibilities of identified projects shall be determined by the 
Parties through the execution of a future interlocal agreement and possible 
subsequent agreements.   

2.4 The focus area of the Authority is the area coextensive with University 
District Revitalization Area established by City Ordinance C-34470 on August 
17, 2009. 

2.5 Parties recognize that multiple parties have previously undertaken a 
planning process to redevelop the property within the focus area and wish to 
implement and build upon such earlier work.  

Section 3. Compliance with Laws 

The Parties, in carrying out and conducting the activities required hereunder and 
furnishing the necessary services, shall at all times carry out such services, and perform 
such activities in accordance with and pursuant to any and all laws of the United States of 
America, the State of Washington, and ordinances of the City, and any rules, regulations, or 
instructions of any agency or department thereof having or asserting authority or 
jurisdiction with reference to any service or activity carried on under and pursuant to this 
agreement. 
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Section 4. Duration and Termination 

There shall be no specific termination date applicable to this MOU.   However, either party 
may, solely within its own discretion, terminate this MOU with 60 days notice to the non-
terminating party. Moreover, in the event that the Parties cannot agree upon a mutually 
acceptable Development Strategy and Work Plan, this MOU shall be of no further effect.   

 

 IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties have executed this memorandum of 
understanding on the date first written above. 
 
 
University District  
Public Development Authority 
 
      
Chairperson of the Board  
 

 
City of Spokane 
 
 
      
David A. Condon, Mayor 

 
 
APPROVED AS TO FORM: 
 
 
__________________________ 
Assistant City Attorney 
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Agenda Item Name SETTING HEARING ON MEDICAL CANNABIS MORATORIUM 

Agenda Wording 

Setting public hearing regarding moratorium on the establishment of medical cannabis collective gardens and 

licensed dispensaries as set forth in Ordinance No. C34968. 

Summary (Background) 

On February 25, 2013, the City Council passed Emergency Ordinance C34968 adopting a moratorium on the 

establishment of medical cannabis collective gardens and licensed dispensaries. The ordinance requires that a 

public hearing be held within 60 days. 
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Agenda Item Name 0440 - FIRE DEPARTMENT - COMMUNITY DETOX RESOLUTION AND CONTRACT 

Agenda Wording 

A resolution declaring Community Detox Services 501(c)(3)(Spokane, WA), a sole source for emergency service 

van patrol to transport publicy intoxicated individuals - not to exceed $200,000 in a two-year span. 

Summary (Background) 

Community Detox Services 501 (c)(3) (Spokane, WA) will be providing transport service, with response time 

critical, training standards and future goals for continued integration into the emergency response system; 

and Community Detox Services of Spokane is the only local company able and willing to provide this service. 

Fiscal Impact Budget Account 

Expense $ 200,000.00 # 0020-88100-66000-54201 

Select $  #  

Select $  #  
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RESOLUTION NO. 2013-0023 

 A resolution declaring Community Detox Services of Spokane, a sole source for 

emergency service van patrol to transport publicly intoxicated individual(s); and 

authorizing the City of Spokane Fire Department to enter into a contract for these 

services. 

 WHEREAS, the transport van service for publicly intoxicated individual is an 

essential element to the downtown business core area, and 

 WHEREAS, Community Detox Services of Spokane will be providing transport 

service, with response time criteria, training standards and future goals for continued 

integration into the emergency response system; and 

 WHEREAS, Community Detox Services of Spokane is the only local company 

able and willing to provide this service; and  

 WHEREAS, the cost of the transport service exceeds the 2013 public bid limit of 

$46,500 for personal services --- Now, Therefore, 

 BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council for the City of Spokane that it hereby 

declares Community Detox Services of Spokane a sole source for emergency service 

van patrol to transport publicly intoxicated individual(s); and  

 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED THAT the Fire Department is authorized to enter 

into a two year contract for these services at a cost not to exceed $200,000.00.  

  
ADOPTED BY THE CITY COUNCIL ON _______________________________ 

 
 
       _______________________________ 
       City Clerk 
 
Approved as to form: 
 
 
__________________________________ 
Assistant City Attorney 
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A resolution regarding amends to the City of Spokane Sustainability Action Plan. 
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On June 28, 2010, the City Council approved Resolution No. 2010-0037, adopting the City of Spokane 

Sustainability Task Force’s Sustainability Action Plan (March 2009) as City government’s primary policy for 

addressing the issues of climate change and energy security. The Spokane City Council values our community’s 

natural beauty, environmental health and prosperity.  The essence of environmental stewardship is increasing 

prosperity while using fewer resources.  It is necessary to amend the City’ 
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On June 28, 2010, the City Council approved Resolution No. 2010-0037, adopting the City of 
Spokane Sustainability Task Force’s Sustainability Action Plan (March 2009) as City 
government’s primary policy for addressing the issues of climate change and energy security. 
The Spokane City Council values our community’s natural beauty, environmental health and 
prosperity.  The essence of environmental stewardship is increasing prosperity while using 
fewer resources.  It is necessary to amend the City’s Sustainability Action Plan to incorporate a 
thorough financial analysis a feasibility study and a metric of environmental effectiveness into 
the implementation of the Sustainability Action Plan. This resolution will amend the 
Sustainability Action Plan to include provisions related to a thorough financial analysis a 
feasibility study and a metric of environmental effectiveness. 
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Resolution No. 2013-0024 
 

A resolution regarding amends to the City of Spokane Sustainability Action Plan. 
 
 WHEREAS, on June 28, 2010, the City Council approved Resolution No. 2010-
0037, adopting the City of Spokane Sustainability Task Force’s Sustainability Action 
Plan (March 2009) as City government’s primary policy for addressing the issues of 
climate change and energy security; and  
 
 WHEREAS, the Spokane City Council values our community’s natural beauty, 
environmental health and prosperity; and 
 

WHEREAS, the essence of environmental stewardship is increasing prosperity 
while using fewer resources; and  

 
WHEREAS, it is necessary to amend the City’s Sustainability Action Plan to 

incorporate a thorough financial analysis a feasibility study and a metric of 
environmental effectiveness into the implementation of the Sustainability Action Plan;     
- - Now, Therefore: 
 

BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council for the City of Spokane that the City 
Council hereby amends the City’s Sustainability Action Plan adopted pursuant to 
Resolution No. 2010-0037 as follows: 
 
5.0 Next Steps 
 

This plan addresses in general terms, actions that should be taken by City 
government to be more sustainable and resilient in the face of issues such as peak oil, 
climate change, and climate mitigation.  However, the Action Plan is just a beginning. 
 

Community outreach and input. The Task Force recommends that the 
community at large have ample opportunity to advise the City on the merits of the Action 
Plan. Then as the City staff develops its implementation strategies, the package can be 
fully articulated in public forums between now and midyear 2009. In that time frame, the 
Task Force understands that City Environmental Programs staff will conduct outreach in 
the community and within the City departments making the Action Plan known to as 
many stakeholders and staff as possible. Community outreach can also be enhanced 
with continuing support from the Outreach Partners (see “Acknowledgements section 

for list). The results of this outreach can then be reported to City Council and the 
community at large. 
  

Also this Action Plan should be presented to the community with a question: 
What can the community beyond City government do to address these concerns 
and capture similar opportunities? Although beyond the scope of this Action Plan it is 

hoped that the resulting conversations will prompt individuals and organizations beyond 
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the confines of City government to find ways to operate more sustainably, for them and 
for the larger community. 
 

Implementation strategies. This Action Plan lays out clear principles and a path 

forward. Specific actions need to follow to make the Action Plan come alive. The exact 
steps to its implementation need to be developed and followed. We understand that the 
Mayor has charged Public Works and Utilities, specifically Environmental 
Programs, to expedite implementation of the Action Plan.  Environmental Programs 

would do this with the assistance of the City’s Green Team of designated staff and 
Department heads. A three- to five-year detailed implementation plan will be 
developed and forwarded to City elected officials for consideration and 
endorsement. Given sufficient data to evaluate effectiveness, the Task Force 

encourages taking early actions where ever practical consistent with Task Force 
recommendations and City goals. 
 

Continued community oversight. To help the Action Plan stay on course and 

come to fruition, the Mayor has asked the Sustainability Task Force to continue to serve 
in an advisory role. To perform this role effectively, the Task Force needs a clear point 
of contact with the City and access to regular reporting of implementation actions under 
taken by the City. 
 

In that advisory capacity, the Task Force recommends that all City departments 
and commissions consider the Guiding Principles, Strategic Priorities, and Proposed 
Recommendations in this plan, and incorporate them as appropriate in their operating 
policies and ongoing operations. The Task Force also notes that the Action Plan 
includes some recommendations that may require amendment of the City’s 
Comprehensive Plan. The decisions to amend the Comprehensive Plan should be 
made in consultation with the Planning Department, and shortly after the Action Plan is 
finalized. At this writing, the City Council is considering an inventory of greenhouse 
gases and what reduction goal(s) might be appropriate for the City. Actions indicated by 
the result of this assessment should be incorporated into the implementation of the 
Action Plan as appropriate. 
 

The time to act is now. The Task Force is confident that implementing this 

Sustainability Action Plan will be instrumental in ensuring that the City has a sustainable 
future that will offer to those who live here and love this place a quality of life that is near 

nature, near perfect. 
 
Any future actions relating to the implementation of the recommendations 

contained within the Plan shall only occur after a thorough financial analysis and 
feasibility study on the merits of the recommendation. The City Council, as a legislative 
body, shall review the results of the analysis and studies and where appropriate take 
subsequent legislative action, after public input and council deliberation, to adopt the 
appropriate ordinances, resolutions or other legislative action. 
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Future actions relating to implementation of the Plan shall only occur after 
creation of a metric of environmental effectiveness, calculating the cost of each strategy 
per unit of CO2e avoided or reduced. The metric of environmental effectiveness will be 
provided to the City Council prior to implementation. 

 
 

ADOPTED by the City Council ______________________, 2013. 
 
 

      ____________________________________  
      City Clerk 
 
Approved as to form: 
 
 
_____________________________  
Assistant City Attorney 
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